
Jen Wilkin  

Jen Wilkin is an author and Bible teacher from Dallas, Texas. She has organized and led 
studies for women in home, church, and parachurch contexts. An advocate for Bible literacy, her 
passion is to see others become articulate and committed followers of Christ, with a clear 
understanding of why they believe what they believe, grounded in the Word of God. She is the 
author of numerous Bible studies and books, including God of Covenant, God of Creation, 1 
Peter, Sermon on the Mount, Women of the Word, None Like Him, and In His Image.  

Jennifer Rothschild  

Jennifer became blind when she was fifteen years old and has experienced firsthand how God’s 
companionship gives her comfort and confidence in every season of her life. Now more than 
thirty years later, as an author and speaker, she boldly and compassionately teaches women 
how to trust God in every season too.  

Known for her substance, signature wit, and down-to-earth style, Jennifer weaves together 
relatable stories with biblical truths to help women know and live for Christ. She has shared her 
practical and inspiring messages to audiences across the country and through media outlets 
including The Dr. Phil Show, Good Morning America, Life Today, and The Billy Graham 
Television Special.  

She is the featured teacher and founder of Fresh Grounded Faith Conferences and publisher of 
the popular online resource for women in ministry called WomensMinistry.net.  

Kelly Minter  

Kelly is passionate about God’s Word and believes it permeates all of life. The personal healing 
and steadfast hope she’s found in the pages of Scripture fuels her passion to connect God’s 
Word to our everyday lives. Along with her love of Scripture, at the core of her ministry is a deep 
affection for the local church and ministering to the vulnerable and forgotten through her 
partnership with Justice & Mercy International, an organization that cares for those in the 
Amazon and Moldova.  

Lysa TerKeurst  

Lysa TerKeurst is the president of Proverbs 31 Ministries and a #1 New York Times best-selling 
author of Forgiving What You Can’t Forget, It’s Not Supposed to Be This Way, Uninvited, 
Finding I AM and twenty-two other books. But to those who know her best she’s just a simple 
girl who holds fast to God’s truth and speaks about hope in the midst of her own struggles and 
hard seasons.  

Lysa is passionate about the Bible. She spends hours each week studying with theological 
experts and has studied extensively in the Holy Land. She loves to make connections between 
the Old and New Testaments. Her deepest desire is to help others experience Jesus by 
unpacking Scripture in the most true and responsible ways that everyone can understand and 
apply.  

Lysa lives with her family in Charlotte, North Carolina. Connect with her at lysaterkeurst.com or 
on social media @LysaTerKeurst.  



 


